


INNOVATIVE FRAME DESIGN
Patented frame concept built from 
7000 series aluminum uses intelligent 
geometry to create a stronger, lighter, 
better performing chair. The Dual 
Interlocking Cross Brace rigidizes the 
frame, so it will remain solid for years 
to come. 

Swing Away Hangers
The only swing away footrest hanger 
with a lifetime warranty! Enjoy the 
simplicity and strength of Catalyst’s 
premium patented hanger design.  Now 
available with multiple hanger release 
options so you can easily optimize 
setup for the client or caregiver.

Universal Axle Plate
The Universal Axle Plate does it all.  
Achieve seat-to-floor heights in 1/2” 
increments and adjust CG over a 3” 
range. With a more rigid design than its 
competitors, Catalyst 5 offers the best 
performing ride in its class.  

5 Transport Weight:

5Ti Transport Weight:

Seat Width:

Seat Depth:

Front Seat Height:

Rear Seat Height:

 Top Frame Tubing Size:

Bottom Frame Tubing Size:

Weight Capacity:

Ansi Resna WC-19 Transit:

12.8 lbs.*

10.8 lbs.*

14-22 in.

14-20 in.

13.5-21 in.

11.5-19.5 in.

1 in.

1.125 in.

300 lbs.

Yes

5.81 kg*

4.90 kg*

36-56 cm

36-51 cm

34-53 cm

29-50 cm 

2.54 cm 

2.86 cm 

136 kg 

Yes

Unmatched Performance.
The professional’s best choice in 
folding ultra-lightweight mobility.

Also Available in Titanium!

16”x16” Frame, 5”x1” Poly Casters, Swing Away Arm 
Receivers. Footrest and Rear Wheels removed.

*

SPECIFICATIONS




